
JUNE 8, 1984, TAX AUCTION

PARCEL #  MINIMUM BID SALE PRICE OTHER

005-400-06 3,500.00 NO BID
006-401-04 3,000.00 NO BID
006-503-05 5,000.00 REDEEMED
021-200-10 500.00 IN LITIGATION
024-320-04 19,500.00 NO BID
026-380-08 1,600.00 2,150.00 SOLD
029-450-17 2,500.00 NO BID
032-257-18 700.00 800.00 SOLD
042-190-06 4,000.00 REDEEMED
042-330-14 4,250.00 NO BID
043-010-14 10,000.00 REDEEMED
043-520-14 200.00 250.00 SOLD
046-210-36 4,400.00 NO BID
051-260-26 2,500.00 REDEEMED
058-020-15 16,500.00 REDEEMED
075-030-03 25,000.00 REDEEMED
084-350-13 10,000.00 NO BID
088-020-06 7,500.00 REDEEMED
097-020-19 9,500.00 REDEEMED
097-310-08 8,250.00 REDEEMED
097-310-11 27,000.00 REDEEMED
106-440-06 47,500.00 REDEEMED
106-470-03 1,750.00 1,750.00 SOLD
108-270-06 7,500.00 NO BID
305-140-11 11,250.00 REDEEMED
307-300-12 27,250.00 REDEEMED
704-120-16 2,500.00 REDEEMED
704-120-18 2,500.00 3,200.00 SOLD


