
JANUARY 30, 1987, TAX AUCTION

PARCEL #  MINIMUM BID SALE PRICE OTHER

005-400-06 1,750.00 1,750.00 SOLD
005-620-02 22,500.00 REDEEMED
006-150-26 250.00 REDEEMED
006-242-16 16,000.00 REDEEMED
006-390-33 250.00 REDEEMED
007-212-07 4,000.00 REDEEMED
007-213-02 4,000.00 REDEEMED
011-540-51 50.00 400.00 SOLD
014-970-16 11,500.00 REDEEMED
016-190-37 16,500.00 REDEEMED
016-560-17 100,000.00 REDEEMED
016-560-18 10,750.00 REDEEMED
019-400-47 4,200.00 4,200.00 SOLD
019-410-22 3,750.00 NO BID
022-290-17 7,750.00 REDEEMED
022-300-27 11,000.00 REDEEMED
022-300-28 5,000.00 NO BID
022-300-29 5,000.00 NO BID
024-320-04 16,500.00 NO BID
026-150-17 2,000.00 NO BID
026-150-30-13 2,375.00 NO BID
026-150-30-14 4,750.00 NO BID
026-150-33 2,750.00 NO BID
026-150-34 2,000.00 NO BID
026-150-44 9,500.00 NO BID
026-150-48 3,250.00 3,250.00 SOLD
026-150-50 2,500.00 NO BID
026-150-64 2,000.00 NO BID
026-150-65 11,000.00 11,000.00 SOLD
026-300-44 4,000.00 REDEEMED
026-380-06 5,250.00 REDEEMED
026-380-35 3,000.00 REDEEMED
027-170-18 9,750.00 REDEEMED
028-110-23 50.00 WITHDRAWN BY STATE
029-050-02 28,000.00 REDEEMED
029-080-24 21,500.00 REDEEMED
029-430-03 65,000.00 REDEEMED
029-450-05 18,350.00 REDEEMED
029-450-17 1,000.00 1,000.00 SOLD
029-460-23 11,750.00 REDEEMED
029-460-24 12,000.00 REDEEMED
030-330-24 37,500.00 REDEEMED
031-080-33 7,000.00 REDEEMED
031-080-36 8,750.00 REDEEMED
031-080-37 11,500.00 REDEEMED
032-256-10 50.00 260.00 SOLD
035-210-19 500.00 REDEEMED
042-330-14 3,000.00 4,500.00 SOLD
045-540-02 250.00 700.00 SOLD
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045-540-39 3,000.00 3,000.00 SOLD
046-210-36 3,000.00 3,000.00 SOLD
050-310-24 22,000.00 REDEEMED
050-410-43 34,000.00 REDEEMED
051-160-06 40,000.00 REDEEMED
051-390-03 4,000.00 5,100.00 SOLD
051-390-04 6,000.00 6,000.00 SOLD
052-120-20 50.00 260.00 SOLD
054-150-31 6,250.00 6,250.00 SOLD
058-310-02 7,000.00 REDEEMED
064-350-02 1,500.00 1,600.00 SOLD
064-350-16 1,750.00 1,750.00 SOLD
064-390-11 1,250.00 1,400.00 SOLD
065-126-02 250.00 REDEEMED
065-139-05 5,000.00 REDEEMED
065-139-06 250.00 REDEEMED
065-660-04 250.00 REDEEMED
065-660-09 250.00 760.00 SOLD
066-370-14 7,500.00 REDEEMED
066-500-28 9,500.00 REDEEMED
066-500-48 10,000.00 REDEEMED
067-430-22 100.00 WITHDRAWN
068-380-01 7,750.00 REDEEMED
070-050-64 400.00 400.00 SOLD
074-220-17 7,500.00 REDEEMED
074-300-14 14,250.00 REDEEMED
075-170-39 15,000.00 REDEEMED
075-190-21 25,000.00 REDEEMED
075-320-10 18,000.00 REDEEMED
077-130-13 20,000.00 REDEEMED
078-160-42 25,000.00 REDEEMED
078-160-43 25,000.00 REDEEMED
081-140-21 500.00 880.00 SOLD
081-490-34 22,750.00 REDEEMED
081-630-06 92,500.00 REDEEMED
082-200-23 17,250.00 REDEEMED
083-360-22 7,500.00 NO BID
084-290-18 4,000.00 NO BID
084-350-13 6,250.00 NO BID
085-050-21 36,450.00 REDEEMED
085-210-09 15,000.00 NO BID
088-070-09 250.00 REDEEMED
088-380-02 50.00 175.00 SOLD
096-140-09 11,250.00 NO BID
097-020-55 2,000.00 REDEEMED
097-060-03 50.00 275.00 SOLD
097-110-30 50.00 REDEEMED
098-520-05 7,250.00 NO BID
101-430-01 409,000.00 REDEEMED
102-590-21 4,250.00 REDEEMED
103-780-23 100.00 CANCELLED
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104-390-32 100.00 325.00 SOLD
104-440-47 3,000.00 3,600.00 SOLD
105-620-22 14,000.00 REDEEMED
108-110-27 50.00 100.00 SOLD
108-110-28 100.00 125.00 SOLD
108-260-16 100.00 100.00 SOLD
108-260-18 500.00 550.00 SOLD
108-270-06 1,250.00 1,700.00 SOLD
110-020-35 50.00 125.00 SOLD
201-480-32 21,000.00 REDEEMED
202-120-23 7,000.00 NO BID
202-560-21 22,000.00 REDEEMED
206-020-17 6,250.00 REDEEMED
206-060-05 6,000.00 REDEEMED
206-060-06 6,750.00 REDEEMED
206-060-07 6,500.00 REDEEMED
206-060-22 6,250.00 REDEEMED
206-060-23 6,250.00 REDEEMED
206-060-24 6,250.00 REDEEMED
206-060-25 6,250.00 REDEEMED
206-210-07 9,250.00 REDEEMED
206-290-13 28,750.00 NO BID
206-410-05 15,250.00 REDEEMED
207-380-17 9,000.00 REDEEMED
304-090-01 3,500.00 3,500.00 SOLD
304-360-01 11,000.00 REDEEMED
305-350-08 1,000.00 1,200.00 SOLD
306-270-08 9,000.00 REDEEMED
306-450-13-16 7,295.00 NO BID
306-450-15 30,000.00 NO BID
700-150-22 5,000.00 REDEEMED
700-160-13 5,500.00 NO BID
700-160-17 6,000.00 NO BID
702-070-11 10,750.00 REDEEMED
704-170-02 12,500.00 REDEEMED


