
APRIL 29, 1988, TAX AUCTION

PARCEL # MINIMUM BID SALE PRICE OTHER

007-150-43 3,000.00 4,800.00 SOLD
007-160-13 2,500.00 NO BID
007-160-15 2,750.00 NO BID
007-160-20 1,800.00 1,800.00 SOLD
007-380-48 8,750.00 WITHDRAWN
014-940-33 10,000.00 REDEEMED
014-960-24 250.00 250.00 SOLD
016-320-09 62,500.00 REDEEMED
016-480-23 14,125.00 REDEEMED
019-410-22 1,500.00 NO BID
021-200-10 750.00 REDEEMED
022-300-28 1,875.00 REDEEMED
022-300-29 1,875.00 REDEEMED
023-200-27 1,250.00 REDEEMED
024-320-04 6,000.00 NO BID
026-150-17 1,000.00 1,100.00 SOLD
026-150-19 3,750.00 3,750.00 SOLD
026-150-22 3,750.00 NO BID
026-150-30-13 850.00 WITHDRAWN
026-150-30-14 1,650.00 WITHDRAWN
026-150-33 1,375.00 1,375.00 SOLD
026-150-34 1,000.00 1,000.00 SOLD
026-150-44 3,750.00 NO BID
026-150-50 1,125.00 NO BID
026-150-64 1,000.00 1,000.00 SOLD
026-150-68 4,750.00 NO BID
026-180-43 1,125.00 NO BID
026-290-15 1,250.00 NO BID
026-300-25 1,000.00 NO BID
027-340-01 225.00 REDEEMED
027-340-02 2,400.00 REDEEMED
029-310-25 5,625.00 WITHDRAWN
029-570-10 4,125.00 REDEEMED
030-340-41 9,750.00 REDEEMED
032-041-19 4,125.00 REDEEMED
041-410-52 9,500.00 REDEEMED
043-160-13 4,750.00 REDEEMED
045-530-72 4,250.00 REDEEMED
046-190-28 850.00 950.00 SOLD
046-190-35 4,750.00 REDEEMED
046-190-36 4,750.00 REDEEMED
046-210-09 3,500.00 REDEEMED
051-290-27 10,000.00 REDEEMED
054-170-07 9,000.00 REDEEMED
054-170-09 9,000.00 REDEEMED
056-290-07 12,500.00 REDEEMED
060-560-13 11,250.00 REDEEMED
060-620-02 8,750.00 REDEEMED
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060-640-10 12,375.00 REDEEMED
064-260-30 3,750.00 NO BID
064-380-34 500.00 NO BID
064-420-44 9,000.00 REDEEMED
065-111-01 3,000.00 NO BID
065-111-03 1,875.00 NO BID
065-117-01 1,875.00 NO BID
065-117-03 750.00 750.00 SOLD
065-117-04 3,000.00 NO BID
065-118-01 750.00 NO BID
065-123-01 750.00 NO BID
065-123-05 750.00 NO BID
065-123-07 750.00 NO BID
065-126-03 3,000.00 NO BID
065-137-07 375.00 NO BID
065-145-10 250.00 250.00 SOLD
065-650-08 200.00 NO BID
065-650-10 200.00 NO BID
065-660-40 200.00 200.00 SOLD
065-660-43 200.00 200.00 SOLD
065-670-06 200.00 200.00 SOLD
065-670-08 200.00 200.00 SOLD
065-670-22 200.00 200.00 SOLD
065-680-18 200.00 200.00 SOLD
066-030-19 200.00 600.00 SOLD
066-600-19 6,875.00 REDEEMED
067-330-54 32,500.00 REDEEMED
067-330-55 32,500.00 REDEEMED
067-430-46 15,000.00 REDEEMED
073-070-30 5,500.00 10,000.00 SOLD
079-090-14 12,500.00 REDEEMED
083-360-22 4,375.00 NO BID
084-120-18 20,000.00 REDEEMED
084-290-18 3,000.00 REDEEMED
084-350-13 3,250.00 NO BID
085-040-11 10,500.00 REDEEMED
085-050-21 375.00 REDEEMED
085-210-09 7,000.00 NO BID
093-120-58 14,000.00 REDEEMED
094-470-16 4,125.00 REDEEMED
095-090-16 4,125.00 6,100.00 SOLD
096-140-09 5,625.00 7,000.00 SOLD
096-230-52 3,000.00 REDEEMED
097-110-09 1,000.00 REDEEMED
097-110-10 1,000.00 REDEEMED
097-110-11 1,000.00 REDEEMED
097-110-12 1,000.00 REDEEMED
097-110-28 2,500.00 4,600.00 SOLD
097-140-03 2,250.00 REDEEMED
097-140-04 2,250.00 REDEEMED
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097-140-05 2,125.00 REDEEMED
098-520-05 3,625.00 REDEEMED
099-130-36 9,750.00 REDEEMED
099-190-21 3,875.00 REDEEMED
101-290-21 49,500.00 REDEEMED
101-290-22 27,000.00 REDEEMED
101-430-10 21,250.00 WITHDRAWN
102-590-49 15,000.00 REDEEMED
104-180-48 9,500.00 REDEEMED
108-230-05 1,700.00 WITHDRAWN
109-060-15 1,500.00 REDEEMED
109-130-10 30,000.00 REDEEMED
202-120-23 2,500.00 2,500.00 SOLD
202-120-56 100.00 200.00 SOLD
202-680-20 35,000.00 REDEEMED
202-680-21 100.00 REDEEMED
204-080-06 11,250.00 REDEEMED
206-070-40 7,750.00 REDEEMED
207-210-09 12,000.00 REDEEMED
207-210-10 3,750.00 REDEEMED
207-210-12 4,250.00 REDEEMED
304-080-19 2,000.00 2,000.00 SOLD
304-080-20 1,500.00 1,500.00 SOLD
304-340-01 5,000.00 5,000.00 SOLD
304-370-04 4,250.00 REDEEMED
304-380-04 4,250.00 REDEEMED
304-400-05 4,750.00 REDEEMED
304-400-06 5,000.00 REDEEMED
305-170-20 7,875.00 REDEEMED
305-180-25 11,750.00 REDEEMED
306-270-02 6,000.00 REDEEMED
306-450-13 5,200.00 WITHDRAWN 16.3 UI
306-450-15 15,750.00 15,750.00 SOLD
306-450-20 1,000.00 1,000.00 SOLD
307-160-08 11,000.00 REDEEMED
307-190-08 7,625.00 REDEEMED
700-160-13 3,000.00 3,600.00 SOLD
700-160-17 3,250.00 4,600.00 SOLD
701-050-40 2,500.00 REDEEMED
703-080-15 3,750.00 REDEEMED
704-010-18 10,475.00 REDEEMED
704-060-09 6,725.00 REDEEMED
704-210-28 4,500.00 REDEEMED


