
OCTOBER 10, 1997, TAX AUCTION

PARCEL #  MINIMUM BID SALE PRICE OTHER

005-130-24 3,677.00 Redeemed
005-220-02 2,730.00 Redeemed
005-560-11 491.00 491.00
005-670-20 1,704.00 Redeemed
006-030-15 21,861.00 Withdrawn
006-150-22 2,944.00 Redeemed
006-280-15 2,576.00 No Bid
006-450-43 7,833.00 Redeemed
006-740-01-15    840.00 840.00
22.39% U.I.
006-770-01-15 2,979.00 4,600.00
22.39% U.I.
006-870-36 7,672.00 Withdrawn
007-070-07 2,589.00 No Bid
007-150-24 900.00 900.00
007-160-13 4,587.00 No Bid
011-620-04 1,759.00 Redeemed
011-680-05 6,726.00 Redeemed
011-690-37 4,138.00 7,000.00
011-690-38 3,198.00 Redeemed
011-810-08 5,441.00 Redeemed
Formerly 011-550-65
016-100-16 798.00 Redeemed
016-530-01 4,538.00 Redeemed
016-540-10 1,821.00 Redeemed
018-500-11 7,589.00 Redeemed
018-530-37 10,019.00 Redeemed
019-240-10 1,594.00 Redeemed
019-310-18 1,190.00 Redeemed
022-340-05 1,458.00 Redeemed
023-260-06 9,364.00 17,000.00
026-070-36 3,718.00 10,100.00
026-070-37 4,533.00 10,100.00
026-120-37 12,834.00 12,834.00
026-150-17 1,096.00 1,096.00
026-200-39 1,257.00 1,257.00
026-200-48 1,774.00 1,900.00
026-300-27 449.00 1,000.00
026-300-41 1,155.00 No Bid
026-380-08 857.00 Redeemed
027-330-03 1,410.00 Redeemed
028-140-06 4,305.00 Redeemed
028-190-25 1,907.00 Withdrawn/deceased
028-200-46 4,634.00 Redeemed
029-210-11 3,705.00 Redeemed
029-390-13 1,630.00 Redeemed



PARCEL #  MINIMUM BID SALE PRICE OTHER

029-390-15 1,374.00 Redeemed
029-460-23 2,637.00 Redeemed
029-460-24 876.00 Redeemed
029-460-34 6,726.00 No Bid
029-560-03 3,226.00 No Bid
030-060-02 1,738.00 1,738.00
030-060-26 616.00 1,100.00
030-310-33 3,885.00 Redeemed
032-220-07 6,934.00 Redeemed
Formerly 032-222-07
034-010-13 637.00 Redeemed
034-010-14 3,516.00 Redeemed
035-210-19 563.00 1,300.00
041-300-21 4,011.00 Redeemed
042-110-02 3,306.00 8,200.00
042-120-19 11,709.00 Redeemed
042-180-15 4,842.00 5,800.00
043-060-28 3,525.00 5,300.00
043-220-23 1,469.00 Redeemed
044-150-12 3,624.00 Redeemed
045-070-21 2,631.00 Redeemed
045-170-29 4,909.00 Redeemed
045-740-17 3,248.00 3,500.00
Formerly 045-530-73
045-760-09 7,913.00 8,900.00
Formerly 045-530-18
046-210-40 4,289.00 4,289.00
046-230-47 6,957.00 6,957.00
048-220-07 49,759.00 No Bid
048-240-57 110,884.00 Redeemed
049-080-02 1,637.00 Redeemed
051-110-37 16,307.00 35,000.00
051-220-16 2,910.00 Redeemed
051-260-28 7,094.00 Redeemed
054-470-27 29,196.00 Redeemed
055-410-25 494.00 No Bid
056-120-01 739.00 2,100.00
056-120-07 1,637.00 2,800.00
056-270-15 1,278.00 1,500.00
059-360-19 205,601.00 No Bid
060-360-04 3,295.00 Redeemed
061-450-13 7,361.00 Redeemed
064-020-01 15,550.00 Withdrawn
064-040-19 40,434.00 Withdrawn
064-390-09 3,719.00 Withdrawn/deceased
064-420-06 3,696.00 Redeemed
065-550-04 44,162.00 Withdrawn
067-330-22 13,077.00 41,000.00
068-210-10 5,546.00 8,100.00
068-240-10 4,085.00 Redeemed
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074-340-02 21,040.00 Withdrawn
075-130-04 4,828.00 6,000.00
077-490-03 2,355.00 Redeemed
078-160-14 9,543.00 Redeemed
082-180-25 514.00 800.00
082-200-24 10,883.00 Redeemed
084-130-06 1,669.00 1,800.00
084-170-13 10,913.00 Redeemed
084-200-18 5,697.00 5,697.00
084-310-33 34,993.00 Redeemed
084-350-17 2,285.00 2,600.00
085-020-21 1,592.00 1,592.00
086-080-11 3,882.00 Redeemed
086-400-06 22,760.00 Redeemed
Formerly 086-330-14
087-040-41 6,842.00 Redeemed
090-380-02 599.00 No Bid
090-420-08 7,631.00 Withdrawn
094-450-20 18,264.00 Withdrawn
094-500-14 2,456.00 2,456.00
094-500-48 921.00 1,500.00
094-500-59 6,549.00 Redeemed
097-110-25 651.00 Withdrawn
097-120-01 2,184.00 Redeemed
097-130-13 942.00 1,600.00
097-370-17 6,392.00 Redeemed
Formerly 097-150-23
097-370-19 3,526.00 4,800.00
098-070-14 850.00 No Bid
098-090-01 1,056.00 1,056.00
098-130-28 1,271.00 1,271.00
099-370-19 2,878.00 Redeemed
101-440-34 1,529.00 Redeemed
103-160-05 10,001.00 Redeemed
104-010-21 8,592.00 No Bid
104-010-22 2,349.00 Redeemed
104-620-09 22,315.00 Redeemed
104-680-17 2,610.00 4,400.00
105-170-23 4,164.00 Redeemed
105-450-52 5,808.00 Canceled by Assor
108-340-04 3,372.00 Redeemed
110-210-47 26,018.00 Redeemed
112-220-08 932.00 1,500.00
Formerly 106-090-08
113-070-03 5,738.00 Redeemed
Formerly 066-660-03
115-090-04 4,311.00 9,300.00
115-170-01 398,870.00 No Bid
116-030-02 656.00 Redeemed
Formerly 072-030-03
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116-170-15 7,394.00 16,000.00
Formerly 072-500-15
116-420-02 3,494.00 4,200.00
116-480-17 7,111.00 Withdrawn
117-250-10 33,261.00 No Bid
Formerly 072-230-08
202-180-01 728.00 728.00
205-030-03 6,749.00 Redeemed
205-270-06 3,415.00 Redeemed
205-500-09 6,582.00 Redeemed
206-090-06 1,398.00 Redeemed
207-200-32 16,531.00 25,100.00
207-250-08 6,231.00 Redeemed
207-260-07 3,065.00 Redeemed
207-340-06 4,065.00 4,065.00
208-220-07 8,352.00 Withdrawn
304-010-35 2,068.00 Redeemed
304-080-19 3,217.00 No Bid
304-340-30 2,383.00 3,000.00
304-350-34 1,310.00 Redeemed
305-160-12 695.00 Redeemed
306-180-06 21,681.00 21,681.00
306-230-27 6,584.00 Redeemed
306-450-13-13 38.04 UI 15,908.00 No Bid
703-080-16 4,564.00 Redeemed
703-120-06 4,626.00 Redeemed
703-130-07 1,454.00 Redeemed
704-010-18 10,301.00 Withdrawn
704-060-09 6,785.00 Withdrawn
704-100-28 ½ U.I. 6,389.00 No Bid


