
            Results of the October 3, 2003,Tax Auction
Offered:  12 Redeemed:  16 Claim Deadline:  October 4, 2004
Sold:  4 Removed:  24
Total of Sales:  $29,000 No Bid:  9

Item Minimum Sale Excess
# Assessment # Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

1 006-280-015 VANSANT MILTON 4,575.00 No Bid            --
2 006-450-025 WALKER KATHLEEN C 4,350.00 10,500.00 5,600.79
3 006-450-026 WALKER KATHLEEN C 2,195.00 8,100.00 5,628.69
4 006-720-026 WALKER CYNTHIA K 765.00 6,200.00 5,349.44
5 007-130-003 DUFFY KATHLEEN L 19,135.00 No Bid            --
6 007-250-008-810 REDEEMED 3,720.00
7 028-220-013 REDEEMED 1,735.00
8 029-460-021 REDEEMED 3,260.00
9 029-470-012 REMOVED 5,118.00
10 043-200-029 REDEEMED 520.00
11 043-200-030 REDEEMED 525.00
12 043-200-031 REDEEMED 560.00
13 045-670-010 REDEEMED 2,950.00
14 046-190-035 REMOVED 5,352.00
15 046-190-036 REMOVED 5,352.00
16 059-360-019 TRI COUNTIES BANK 372,220.00 No Bid            --
17 059-360-032 BENEFICIAL CALIFORNIA INC 45,945.00 No Bid            --
18 064-040-019 ARCTIC RESOURCES INC 75,220.00 No Bid            --
19 065-550-004 ARCTIC RESOURCES INC 82,235.00 No Bid            --
20 074-340-002 REDEEMED 57570.00
21 079-140-040 REDEEMED 7,680.00
22 083-290-003 REMOVED 12,830.00
23 097-010-068 REDEEMED 3,520.00
24 097-110-002 REDEEMED 2,355.00
25 097-110-003 REDEEMED 725.00
26 097-110-007 REDEEMED 965.00
27 097-110-008 REMOVED 1,992.00
28 097-110-009 REMOVED 1,980.00
29 097-110-010 REMOVED 1,980.00
30 097-110-011 REMOVED 1,980.00
31 097-110-012 REMOVED 1,980.00
32 097-110-026 REDEEMED 705.00
33 097-140-003 REMOVED 3,579.00
34 097-140-004 REMOVED 2,920.00
35 097-140-005 REMOVED 2,795.00
36 097-150-016 REMOVED 59,030.00
37 114-390-030 REDEEMED 5,010.00
38 115-170-001 REMOVED 806,625.00
39 117-250-003 B H S INVESTMENTS 79,825.00 No Bid            --
40 117-250-010 B H S INVESTMENTS 50,755.00 No Bid            --
41 117-270-012 FERANDELL TENNIS COURTS INC 26,040.00 No Bid            --
42 205-300-011 REDEEMED 3,857.00
43 304-370-004 REMOVED 10,090.00
44 304-370-005 REMOVED 9,540.00
45 304-370-007 REMOVED 10,816.00
46 304-380-005 REMOVED 8,124.00
47 304-380-008 REMOVED 28,193.00
48 304-400-005 REMOVED 9,304.00
49 304-400-006 REMOVED 10,050.00
50 305-180-025 REMOVED 16,794.00
51 305-350-008 MARTIN CRAIG 2,355.00 4,200.00 1,742.67
52 306-560-035 REMOVED 443,230.00

Formerly a portion of 306-560-027
53 306-560-033 REMOVED 960,580.00


