
Offered:  37 Redeemed:   23 Deeds Filed:  March 22, 2011

Sold: 9 Withdrawn:   0  

Total Sales: $190,600.00 No Bid:         5 Claim Deadline: March 22, 2012

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

1 005-440-033-000 LINDSEY ODELL 2,700.00 7,250.00 4,701.64

2 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B 15,500.00 NO BID

3 007-010-061-000 MINER WILLIAM & VIOLA M JT REDEEMED

4 007-050-011-000 MINER WILLIAM JR REDEEMED

8 030-150-037-000 MUSHOLT MICHAEL E & LORRAINE REDEEMED

9 043-010-017-000 WYATT STEVEN C & NANCY L REDEEMED

10 043-050-016-000 TIDWELL DAVID L & SHARON A JT REDEEMED

13 049-040-008-000 CAPOCCI TRACY L REDEEMED

14 055-400-010-000 POOLE BARBARA B & MASSEY PATRICIA A 2,900.00 35,500.00 32,641.35

15 055-460-018-000 SCHAUER DAVID & ANDREA 16,700.00 60,200.00 43,444.77

16 059-360-019-000 TRI COUNTIES BANK 170,000.00 NO BID

17 060-130-022-000 BROWN GREGORY G REDEEMED

18 & 19 060-340-003 & 008-000 SANTERO RICK & RONDA JT REDEEMED

21 064-110-014-000 SMITH DONALD G ETAL REDEEMED

22 064-350-002-000 CASE JOEL A 1,800.00 NO BID

23 064-350-016-000 ARAFEH SAMIR 1,100.00 NO BID

24 065-110-013-000 GRAVES WALLACE H ETAL 1,200.00 1,200.00 0.00

25 065-220-014-000 SALAS MARIA ELENA REDEEMED

26 087-300-033-000 THREADED PRODUCTS AND SURPLUS 

MERCHANDISE LLC REDEEMED

27 091-240-004-000 DORRELL FLOYD & LORNA JT REDEEMED

28 091-240-005-000 DORRELL FLOYD & LORNA JT REDEEMED

30 094-510-028-000 SHULDA JOHN F JR REDEEMED

33 097-220-003-000 BECKETT DAVID NEAL REDEEMED

34 099-190-023-000 SHASTA LAND PRESERVE INC REDEEMED

35 114-090-011-000 PORTERFIELD TRACY BOOTH REDEEMED

36 115-080-012-000 LEWIS JEWLLEAN ETAL REDEEMED

37 201-730-043-000 HAYS KIRK D & HAYS PAUL C TC REDEEMED

38 201-730-044-000 HAYS KIRK D & HAYS PAUL C TC REDEEMED

39 201-730-045-000 HAYS KIRK D & HAYS PAUL C TC REDEEMED

40 201-810-001-000 HAYS KIRK D & HAYS PAUL C TC REDEEMED

41 205-260-030-000 DAHLBERG EDWARD H & CAROLYN 5,400.00 38,800.00 33,458.00

42 206-090-003-000 KINYON DOUGLAS J 3,400.00 15,800.00 12,500.77

43 304-070-013-000 SILVER DANA RICHARD 4,100.00 4,100.00 0.00

44 304-070-014-000 AMES DONALD B 8,300.00 NO BID

45 304-140-023-000 KARA JOSEF 6,400.00 6,900.00 570.08

46 305-410-004-000 HAWKINS NEIL L & MARIE E JT REDEEMED

47 703-220-011-000 CHAMBERS ELIZABETH ETAL 2,800.00 28,100.00 25,261.21

TOTAL SALES: 190,600.00

TOTAL GROSS EXCESS PROCEEDS: 147,876.18

Results of the February 26 - March 1, 2011, Online Tax Auction


