
Offered:  2 Redeemed:   0 Deeds Filed:  None Filed

Sold: 0 Withdrawn:    1 

Total Sales: $0.00 No Bid:          2 Claim Deadline: 

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

34 065-110-008-000 GRAVES WALLACE H ETAL 37,000.00 No Bid 0.00

54 116-110-023-000 MILLER DANIEL R & BURD KITTY K WITHDRAWN 0.00 0.00

TOTAL SALES: 0.00

TOTAL GROSS EXCESS PROCEEDS: 0.00

Item 34 received no sealed bid on 02/21/2012, added to online auction list

Item 54 received no sealed bid on 02/21/2012, withdrawn from auction

Offered:  25 Redeemed:   37 Deeds Filed:        

Sold: 13 Withdrawn:     2

Total Sales: $108,643.00 No Bid:        13 Claim Deadline: 

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

1 005-520-035-000 MOUNTAIN WEST INVESTMENTS LLC REDEEMED

2 006-040-024-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 331,900.00 NO BID

3 006-040-025-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 138,800.00 NO BID

4 006-040-026-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 152,400.00 NO BID

5 006-040-027-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 77,100.00 NO BID

6 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B 17,200.00 NO BID

7 011-330-058-000 WORDLOW CHRISTOPHER ADAIR ETAL REDEEMED

8 014-540-026-000 BRANSCUM I EUGENE REDEEMED

9 026-300-031-000 FRIETAS VERNON D JR REDEEMED

10 026-300-032-000 FRIETAS VERNON D JR REDEEMED

11 026-300-041-000 FRIETAS VERNON D JR REDEEMED

12 026-300-044-000 FRIETAS VERNON D JR 1,200.00 1,200.00 29.32

13 028-030-013-000 PURDY JENNIFER LYNN REDEEMED

14 028-180-047-000 BOALS MANUEL BERNARD REDEEMED

15 028-180-075-000 SINGH BALVINDER ETAL 109,800.00 NO BID

16 028-420-023-000 CHILDERS MICHAEL R & RONNI B REDEEMED

17 030-220-008-000 SELLARS DAVID L 9,600.00 NO BID

18 031-100-005-000 WILSON MERLE & HAMPTON REDEEMED

19 043-020-008-000 SMITH THOMAS H REDEEMED

20 043-220-020-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

21 046-410-063-000 SINGH HARDIP ETAL REDEEMED

22 046-430-001-000 ELAM MICHELLE HELEN 1,000.00 2,305.00 1,362.55

23 046-430-002-000 ELAM MICHELLE HELEN 1,000.00 2,295.00 1,307.50

24 046-430-003-000 ELAM MICHELLE HELEN 1,800.00 3,693.00 1,987.47

25 051-140-006-000 PIGMAN ROBERT E REDEEMED

26 051-340-008-000 CAPELLI DAVID R TR 15,500.00 NO BID

27 059-010-007-000 HARDING GEORGE E REDEEMED

28 059-360-019-000 TRI COUNTIES BANK 120,000.00 NO BID

29 060-530-043-000 MULHALL JAMES MICHAEL TR REDEEMED

30 061-410-003-000 REGNART DIANE LEE 26,100.00 80,100.00 53,992.83

31 064-350-002-000 CASE JOEL A 2,500.00 3,000.00 740.85

32 064-350-016-000 ARAFEH SAMIR REDEEMED

33 064-410-002-000 KEES LEROY & MARY JT REDEEMED

34 065-110-008-000 GRAVES WALLACE H ETAL 37,100.00 NO BID

35 065-150-065-000 CHARLES MICHAEL REDEEMED

36 065-160-002-000 BACA EULALIO & MARY 1,300.00 1,650.00 566.21

37 071-180-002-000 ALLAN FLORENCE DOROTHY SP TRUST WITHDRAWN

38 074-360-019-000 ADAMS MICHAEL & DONNA REDEEMED

39 077-170-004-000 SAGE EUGENIA ARNEZ REDEEMED

40 082-120-032-000 RAISANEN CAROLE A REDEEMED

41 084-350-018-000 ELDER ROBERT & WENDI JT 2,200.00 4,600.00 2,410.00

42 087-150-011-000 DANGELO PAUL & SHERI WITHDRAWN

43 098-090-044-000 PEARSON ERIK W & CHRISTINE J 1,600.00 1,700.00 138.96

44 098-110-003-000 MITTS SHEILA K REDEEMED

45 098-110-016-000 MITTS SHEILA REDEEMED

46 098-110-039-000 PEARSON ERIK W & CHRISTINE J 1,600.00 2,500.00 944.89

47 098-110-041-000 PEARSON ERIK W & CHRISTINE J 1,600.00 2,500.00 938.96

48 098-120-035-000 PAKENHAM JOHN A & JEANNE M 2500.00 3,100.00 624.53

49 098-370-006-000 SHAFER BRIAN LOUIS REDEEMED

50 101-150-078-000 FLOURNOY DIRK R REDEEMED

Results of the February 21, 2012 Sealed Bid Tax Auction

Results of the February 24 - February 27, 2012 Online Tax Auction

March 12, 2012

 March 12, 2013



51 101-480-013-000 LEWIS SCOTT E & PAULA M TR REDEEMED

52 105-620-058-000 ZEIS JOHN R & CHRISTINE F REDEEMED

53 113-090-014-000 RIDER KAREN LYNN TR REDEEMED

55 201-520-006-000 JOHNSON WANDA JEAN REDEEMED

56 203-200-017-000 WILSON KEITH A REDEEMED

57 205-240-037-000 HOWDY LANAE ETAL REDEEMED

58 207-130-013-000 LEAVITT WILLIAM LEWIS REDEEMED

59 304-070-014-000 AMES DONALD B 9600.00 NO BID

60 304-130-030-000 CURTIS THOMAS J 8000.00 NO BID

61 306-030-008-000 MARQUIS DANNY ROBERT REDEEMED

62 307-280-006-000 JONES DOLLY W 97200.00 NO BID

63 701-140-028-000 BRUNER TRUEMAN R FAMILY TRUST REDEEMED

64 701-330-020-000 LIDIE VICTORIA A REDEEMED

65 704-300-009-000 PAYNE KAREN REDEEMED

TOTAL SALES: 108,643.00

TOTAL GROSS EXCESS PROCEEDS: 65,044.07

Offered:  13 Redeemed:   0 Deeds Filed:         

Sold: 3 Withdrawn:   0   

Total Sales: $36,100.00 No Bid:        10 Claim Deadline: 

The following items received no bid at the February 24-27, 2012 Online Tax Auction

The following items were added to the March 18, 2012 Online Re-Offer Tax Auction; Some with reduced minimum bid

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

2 006-040-024-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 118,200.00

3 006-040-025-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 58,100.00

4 006-040-026-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 82,200.00

5 006-040-027-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 42,600.00

6 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B 5,000.00

15 028-180-075-000 SINGH BALVINDER ETAL 109,800.00

17 030-220-008-000 SELLARS DAVID L 9,600.00

26 051-340-008-000 CAPELLI DAVID R TR 15,500.00 25,100.00 9,476.70

28 059-360-019-000 TRI COUNTIES BANK 75,000.00

34 065-110-008-000 GRAVES WALLACE H ETAL 10,000.00 10,000.00 -27,354.69

59 304-070-014-000 AMES DONALD B 1000.00 1,000.00 -8,571.63

60 304-130-030-000 CURTIS THOMAS J 8000.00

62 307-280-006-000 JONES DOLLY W 40000.00

TOTAL SALES: 36,100.00

TOTAL GROSS EXCESS PROCEEDS: -26,449.62

March 30, 2012

March 30, 2013

Results of the March 18, 2012 Online Re-Offer Tax Auction


