
Offered:  100 Redeemed:    44 Date Deeds Filed:  03/07/2013

Sold: 29 Withdrawn:     10

Total Sales: $554,000.00 No Bid:          17 03/07/2014

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

1 005-260-026-000 MCCUTCHEON JONATHAN P & REBECCA A TR REDEEMED

2 005-590-031-000 GOODALE DAVID C REDEEMED

3 006-040-024-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 389,400.00 NO BID

4 006-040-025-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D ETAL 161,500.00 NO BID

5 006-040-026-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D ETAL 174,900.00 NO BID

6 006-040-027-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D ETAL WITHDRAWN

7 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B WITHDRAWN

8 006-210-039-000 FIVE OAKS DEVELOPMENT INC 2,800.00 4,500.00 1,700.00

9 018-660-003-000 MACHON JOHN R & DARLENE 2,700.00 6,500.00 3,800.00

10 020-040-015-000 PIERSON VERNON LEROY 3,100.00 3,100.00 0.00

11 021-280-006-000 GIDA FRANK D REDEEMED

12 026-300-018-000 CLAPP JAMES REDEEMED

13 028-180-075-000 SINGH BALVINDER & HARNEK 125,800.00 NO BID

14 028-310-047-000 YINGLING HALL C III & ALICE 2,100.00 NO BID

15 030-050-019-000 MARX CHERYL L REV TRUST 2000 2,400.00 5,000.00 2,600.00

16 & 17 030-140-013-000 & 030-

340-018-000

MUSHOLT LORRIANE K REDEEMED

18 030-180-018-000 HANAN LYNN WILLIAM & RAMONA L 9,400.00 NO BID

19 030-220-008-000 SELLARS DAVID L 11,400.00 5,000.00 -6,400.00

20 032-060-028-000 DOMKAM EMMANUEL REDEEMED

21 042-140-010-000 STARR STEVE & JULIE ANN 9,600.00 25,800.00 16,200.00

22 045-500-009-000 TWINING TODD & MARY REDEEMED

23 049-210-014-000 MCKITRICK CHARLENE RAE REDEEMED

24 049-420-018-000 PICKERN MICHELLE REDEEMED

25 050-270-025-000 GSJ COMPANY LLC WITHDRAWN

26 051-150-031-000 COX VERNON EDWARD REDEEMED

27 051-270-018-000 DORRELL RALPH EDWARD REDEEMED

28 051-280-010-000 SPANGLE DANIEL W ETAL REDEEMED

29 055-250-017-000 ABBOTT JENNIFER 19,800.00 19,800.00 0.00

30 059-360-019-000 TRI COUNTIES BANK 666,100.00 57,500.00 -608,600.00

31 061-470-063-000 GASPER LAWRENCE W & JENNIFER L REDEEMED

32 064-100-031-000 AHLUWALIA HARINDERPAL 119,900.00 119,900.00 0.00

33 064-300-008-000 MEYER BETTY L REDEEMED

34 064-330-040-000 THOMAS VELMA 17,100.00 10,000.00 -7,100.00

35 065-170-003-000 COX VERNON REDEEMED

36 067-090-043-000 LEITNER MAURY ALAN & SPICER KATHERINE NICOLE REDEEMED

37 070-060-008-000 GARDNER DOUGLAS L & JOYCE REDEEMED

38 070-160-044-000 GSJ COMPANY LLC REDEEMED

39 070-280-029-000 MCCUTCHEON JONATHAN P & REBECCA A TR REDEEMED

40 071-180-002-000 ALLAN FLORENCE DOROTHY TR WITHDRAWN

41 077-530-020-000 YEARTON REAN S REDEEMED

42 086-370-004-000 TUCKER ROBERT G REDEEMED

43 086-430-022-000 HANSON PAUL 19,700.00 50,000.00 30,300.00

44 086-430-023-000 SPAHN ROSE MARIE SP TRUST WITHDRAWN

45 087-040-026-000 BALL STAN & KATIE GORDON WITHDRAWN

46 088-190-005-000 CHAMBERS RANDALL F & CINDY L REDEEMED

47 088-270-001-000 ROLEY WARREN A & MELBA M REDEEMED

48 090-090-009-000 CORTEZ FISHIERS INC 1,400.00 5,000.00 3,600.00

49 090-090-010-000 CORTEZ FISHIERS INC 800.00 20,000.00 19,200.00

50 090-100-004-000 CORTEZ FISHIERS INC 1,300.00 1,300.00 0.00

51 091-130-009-000 BAUER WILFRED H & JUDY REDEEMED

52 093-130-006-810 BOND DAVID REDEEMED

53 094-070-042-000 STEWART WAYNE ELDEN SR & BARBARA JANE TR WITHDRAWN

54 094-080-028-000 FOOTS SUE TRUSTEE 3,100.00 15,500.00 12,400.00

55 097-110-008-000 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION ETAL 3,400.00 4,000.00 600.00

56 097-110-009-000 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION ETAL 2,200.00 3,500.00 1,300.00

57 097-110-010-000 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION ETAL 2,400.00 4,200.00 1,800.00

58 097-110-011-000 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION ETAL 2,600.00 3,200.00 600.00

59 097-110-012-000 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION ETAL 2,600.00 4,700.00 2,100.00

60 097-200-006-000 JENKINS STEVE L REDEEMED

61 098-560-002-000 DURBY DACE T REDEEMED

62 104-540-011-000 JOHNSON JOHN A & LOUISE M REDEEMED

63 104-590-009-000 DEERING AMOS & SUNSHINE 6,400.00 NO BID

64 107-410-040-000 KNUTH KRISTOFFER B REDEEMED

65 109-020-027-000 KAASA SIDNEY 22,700.00 22,700.00 0.00
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66 110-020-047-000 DAVIS TERENCE REDEEMED

67 113-250-006-000 HARTIS HAROLD A 3,200.00 7,300.00 4,100.00

68 114-190-011-000 GORRIE DONALD L REDEEMED

69 116-110-023-000 MILLER DANIEL R & BURD KITTY K WITHDRAWN

70 201-010-045-000 RANDLE RAYMOND JR REDEEMED

71 202-160-026-000 KLOOS PIETER & LINDA J REDEEMED

72 203-180-001-000 MCCALL GARY W & LYNN R ETAL WITHDRAWN

73 204-030-018-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TR ETAL 7,400.00 NO BID

74 204-030-019-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TR ETAL 4,300.00 NO BID

75 204-660-006-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TRUSTEE ETAL 10,800.00 NO BID

76 205-450-009-000 POND KENNY L ETAL 81,400.00 NO BID

77 205-450-011-000 POND KENNY L ETAL REDEEMED

78 206-290-013-000 HAZE BETTY L 3,700.00 33,000.00 29,300.00

79 207-580-006-000 WUSSTIG GEORGE S REDEEMED

80 304-080-030-000 SALAZAR ANTONIA A REDEEMED

81 304-090-026-000 DUNHAM RICK SR & LISA 4,200.00 NO BID

82 304-100-040-000 GUNDRED JEFFREY & PEGGY 13,700.00 NO BID

83 304-130-030-000 CURTIS THOMAS J 9,500.00 NO BID

84 304-400-005-810 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION REDEEMED

85 304-400-006-810 PETERSON CHARLIE J & MARION REDEEMED

86 305-300-009-000 CLARK EVONNE REDEEMED

87 306-030-005-000 BOYCE JOSEPH W ETAL 5,700.00 31,000.00 25,300.00

88 306-230-008-000 GUERRERO MARGUERITA L 1,600.00 26,500.00 24,900.00

89 306-380-012-000 MIEGER GEORGE & JOSEPH 32,300.00 NO BID

90 306-440-010-000 SMITH EUGENE & ELLEN REDEEMED

91 306-630-003-000 GHISELLI JOHN S & CAROL TR ETAL 33,400.00 15,000.00 -18,400.00

92 306-630-004-000 GHISELLI JOHN S & CAROL TR ETAL 38,800.00 15,000.00 -23,800.00

93 306-630-026-000 BILLINGS ROY U TR ETAL 34,000.00 15,000.00 -19,000.00

94 306-630-029-000 GHISELLI JOHN S & CAROL TR ETAL 33,500.00 NO BID

95 306-630-030-000 GELLMAN SAMUEL H & MARK S TR ETAL 33,500.00 NO BID

96 307-030-013-000 JEWELL SANDRA L ETAL REDEEMED

97 307-040-001-000 ST PIERRE GARY WITHDRAWN

98 307-280-006-000 JONES DOLLY W 105,900.00 20,000.00 -85,900.00

99 701-080-013-000 LAMONTE MYRTIS BERNICE TR REDEEMED

100 704-100-032-000 1 REDEEMED


