
and February 26, 2014 Sealed-Bid Tax Auction

Offered:  42 Redeemed:  78 Date Deeds Filed:  3/14/2014

Sold: 35 Withdrawn:  11

Total Sales: $517,675.00 No Bid:          7

3/16/2015

Gross

Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess

No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds

1 005-390-035-000 JOHNSON LENNIS W & ARLITA E REDEEMED

2 005-620-039-000 LAWSON ALBERT W & JANICE G REDEEMED

3 006-040-024-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 452,000.00 NO BID

4 006-040-025-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 186,200.00 NO BID

5 006-040-026-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 199,500.00 NO BID

6 006-040-027-000 WHITEHEAD ROBERT D TR ETAL 100,400.00 NO BID

7 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B 20,400.00 2,000.00 (18,400.00)

8 006-130-036-000 BAKERIAN TONY & LEE JULIE 2,400.00 2,400.00 0.00

9 006-440-049-000 FERGUSON DEBORAH MAJHAUNTA 5,700.00 2,500.00 (3,200.00)

10 006-470-008-000 BAKERIAN TONY ETAL 3,200.00 1,700.00 (1,500.00)

11 007-090-105-000 CANLAS FLOR & FIELD GAVIN 2,400.00 2,400.00 0.00

12 016-520-031-000 BERGIN PRESTON & RICE ULLA SUNDQUIST 2,200.00 2,200.00 0.00

13 017-570-020-000 DANTE ROBERT E & YVONNE M REDEEMED

14 018-290-009-000 PAGAN DEE ALGER 21,500.00 26,000.00 4,500.00

15 019-340-005-000 STERLING HOLDING LLC REDEEMED

16 023-170-032-000 SEFTON WILLIAM PAUL II REDEEMED

17 023-480-014-000 MARX CHERYL L REVOCABLE TRUST REDEEMED

18 023-500-022-000 JOSEPH JURAL R & JUDITH E 3,100.00 9,000.00 5,900.00

19 023-500-023-000 JOSEPH JURAL R & JUDITH E 3,100.00 9,000.00 5,900.00

20 026-320-010-000 SEABOURN JERRY W & SHIRLEY G REDEEMED

21 026-400-010-000 GARNER REGINALD M 1,000.00 6,000.00 5,000.00

22 028-180-075-000 SINGH BALVINDER & HARNEK 142,200.00 50,000.00 (92,200.00)

23 028-200-019-000 RODRIGUEZ KENNETH J & KRISTI REDEEMED

24 028-310-047-000 YINGLING HALL C III & ALICE 2,700.00 2,000.00 (700.00)

25 030-180-018-000 HANAN LYNN WILLIAM & RAMONA L 11,100.00 8,500.00 (2,600.00)

26 035-220-028-000 HAT CREEK RESORTS LLC REDEEMED

27 035-220-029-000 HAT CREEK RESORTS LLC REDEEMED

28 035-480-002-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC & WC 

BADGERS LLC

REDEEMED

29 035-480-013-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC ETAL REDEEMED

30 035-480-014-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC & WC 

BADGERS LLC

REDEEMED

31 035-480-015-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC ETAL REDEEMED

32 035-480-023-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC & WC 

BADGERS LLC

REDEEMED

33 035-480-025-000 HAT CREEK RESORT & RV PARK LLC & WC 

BADGERS LLC

REDEEMED

34 035-500-006-000 HARRIS ARNOLD H REDEEMED

35 043-200-029-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

36 043-200-030-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

37 043-200-031-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

38 043-230-014-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

39 044-150-010-000 DESHIELDS BRENDA GAIL REDEEMED

40 045-270-032-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

41 045-320-024-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

42 045-320-025-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

43 045-320-026-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

44 045-320-027-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

45 045-330-017-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

46 045-540-001-000 WINSOR CHRISTOPHER K & EDITH M REDEEMED

47 045-740-011-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

48 045-740-013-000 KING RANDAHL MATTHEW ETAL REDEEMED

49 045-750-009-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

50 048-110-034-000 DAVID L WOODFILL 401K PROFIT  SHARING PLAN 

ETAL 

WITHDRAWN

51 050-270-025-000 REDDING BUSINESS TRUST ETAL WITHDRAWN

52 050-310-005-000 EQUITY HOLDING GROUP LLC REDEEMED

53 051-150-013-000 OMANS PATTY & DANIEL REDEEMED

54 051-290-067-000 CLEMENT PATRICK D & TRINA REDEEMED

55 055-420-058-000 HILL ALAN T & BEVERLY A TR REDEEMED

56 061-450-031-000 JASPERSE ARTHUR LAWRENCE REDEEMED

57 064-350-013-000 CAMDEN JAY H WITHDRAWN

58 064-430-013-000 BARNARD JOANNE REDEEMED

59 068-230-065-000 LIVINGSTON MARK W ETAL REDEEMED

60 070-160-044-000 REDDING BUSINESS TRUST ETAL WITHDRAWN

61 071-180-002-000 FLYNN SHIRLEY REDEEMED

62 074-370-010-000 GRIGALBA ARTHUR REDEEMED
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63 075-210-040-000 PRIEBS TRACI L WITHDRAWN

64 075-360-052-000 NORTHERN PACIFIC PROPERTIES LLC 14,300.00 7,500.00 (6,800.00)

65 082-070-011-000 MOORE EDWARD 1,500.00 5,100.00 3,600.00

66 082-200-023-000 CHIRHART MARK L & KEENAN NANCY REDEEMED

67 083-400-007-000 MALAN SAM & HEATHER L 5,600.00 10,000.00 4,400.00

68 086-050-008-000 ANDERSON HILLS LLC 28,800.00 54,000.00 25,200.00

69 086-430-023-000 SPAHN ROSE MARIE SP TRUST WITHDRAWN

70 088-110-025-000 WALKER YUKIKO 25,200.00 4,000.00 (21,200.00)

71 089-030-022-000 WATERHOUSE MARY REDEEMED

72 090-200-008-000 GANGE MARGUERITE ANNELL 8,300.00 19,000.00 10,700.00

73 094-070-042-000 STEWART WAYNE ELDEN SR & BARBARA JANE TR REDEEMED

74 094-490-002-000 BRADY GREG J & DANIELLE CHERRY REDEEMED

75 096-230-026-000 IVEY NOVA RAYDEAN 2,400.00 7,000.00 4,600.00

76 097-110-005-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

77 097-370-019-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

78 098-060-012-000 EDWARDS ED F ETAL REDEEMED

79 098-090-008-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

80 098-090-040-000 BARTSCH SHANNON M & KASTER KRAYTON 900.00 5,200.00 4,300.00

81 098-100-008-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

82 098-110-046-000 HASSINGER CAREY BENJAMIN TR REDEEMED

83 098-130-020-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED

84 098-390-016-000 MCCANTS DENNARD M JR 5,100.00 27,000.00 21,900.00

85 099-370-019-000 HILTY KATHERINE 5,300.00 24,000.00 18,700.00

86 099-370-028-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

87 099-370-029-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

88 103-740-007-000 CRAWFORD DAVID W & SUSAN M REDEEMED

89 104-010-004-000 FORSMAN STANLEY F & COLEEN A REDEEMED

90 104-210-027-000 BENNETTS-HAMREN PATRICIA & HAMREN DANIEL M REDEEMED

91 104-590-009-000 DEERING AMOS & SUNSHINE REDEEMED

92 107-210-009-000 TECH 2 MOTOR SPORTS INC REDEEMED

93 107-560-014-000 ROSS STEVEN R REDEEMED

94 109-290-007-000 HOFFMAN ANTHONY L REDEEMED

95 112-070-009-000 ROSALINE FOOT CARE A PODIATRY GROUP INC REDEEMED

96 113-380-011-000 CMK VESTMENTS LLC 13,600.00 15,000.00 1,400.00

97 114-060-002-000 FROESE EDDIE WITHDRAWN

98 114-390-031-000 EMERSON ELAINE K REDEEMED

99 116-300-004-000 RIGBY EDWARD J & SANDRA S REDEEMED

100 201-730-012-000 RAAB RONALD E & BONA C JT REDEEMED

101 201-750-010-000 RILEY TED ALLEN ETAL 10,400.00 67,000.00 56,600.00

102 202-340-034-000 MONTEREY BAY RESOURCES INC TR REDEEMED

103 202-580-009-000 BAUER WILL & JUDY REDEEMED

104 203-180-001-000 MCCALL GARY W & LYNN R ETAL WITHDRAWN

105 204-030-018-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TR ETAL 9,100.00 10,465.00 1,365.00

106 204-030-019-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TR ETAL 5,400.00 6,210.00 810.00

107 204-660-006-800 LEMM DUWAYNE TRUSTEE ETAL WITHDRAWN

108 204-370-049-000 STARK MICHAEL GEORGE & GLORIA JEAN WITHDRAWN

109 205-430-008-000 HAMMOND JAMES WELLINGTON WITHDRAWN

110 205-490-025-000 MILLER EVORA L REDEEMED

111 205-450-009-000 POND KENNY L ETAL 91,000.00 36,000.00 (55,000.00)

112 206-270-004-000 WILLOTT SHIRLEY 14,600.00 22,000.00 7,400.00

113 206-370-004-000 SONODA BEVERLY C REDEEMED

114 207-250-012-000 BREWER DAVID SCOTT & MORALES DEBORAH REDEEMED

115 207-410-027-000 HETTINGER MARION E & APRIL A REDEEMED

116 207-560-020-000 ENSSLIN ROBERT L & LINDA K REDEEMED

117 208-220-020-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

118 208-220-021-000 EDWARDS ED F & SUSAN L REDEEMED

119 304-080-018-000 WEST COAST RENTAL PROPERTIES LLC 4,400.00 NO BID

120 304-080-019-000 WEST COAST RENTAL PROPERTIES LLC 4,500.00 NO BID

121 304-090-026-000 DUNHAM RICK SR & LISA 5,100.00 NO BID

122 304-100-040-000 GUNDRED JEFFREY & PEGGY 16,300.00 21,000.00 4,700.00

123 304-130-030-000 CURTIS THOMAS J 10,900.00 4,500.00 (6,400.00)

124 304-130-032-000 SAMUELSON STEVEN J & JILL M 3,500.00 1,500.00 (2,000.00)

125 304-370-006-000 MONACO USA REDEEMED

126 306-240-016-000 YACOVETTI BARBARA & KASHKA THOMAS REDEEMED

127 306-380-012-000 MIEGER GEORGE & JOSEPH 37,900.00 15,000.00 (22,900.00)

128 306-630-029-000 GHISELLI JOHN S & CAROL TR ETAL 39,000.00 11,500.00 (27,500.00)

129 306-630-030-000 GELLMAN SAMUEL H & MARK S TR ETAL 39,000.00 21,000.00 (18,000.00)

130 307-040-001-000 ST PIERRE GARY REDEEMED

131 701-100-013-000 OVERTON CHARLES THOMAS ETAL REDEEMED


